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ABSTRACT 
The study examined the role of Human Resource Management Practices (HRMPs) on entrepreneurial 
firms’ growth in South West Nigeria.  This was to entrenching a set of adequate human resource man-
agement practices that can enhance the growth objective of entrepreneurial firms. A structured ques-
tionnaire was used to elicit information on relevant variables of the study. Data collected were ana-
lysed using descriptive and inferential statistics with the aid of IBM SPSS statistics version 21.  The 
results revealed that employees’ training (    = 31.03, s=8.6405); controlling (   = 25.95, s= 6.721)); 
organizing manpower (    = 23.20, s = 5.760); job analysis and design (   = 23.10, s = 5.883) were 
reasonably practiced among the firms under the study. Whereas motivating strategies (    = 21.5, s = 
5.2905; recruitment and selection (   = 20.45, s = 4.831); and manpower planning (    = 18.72, s = 
4.786) fell below the agreement criterion (    = 23.0).  However, it was established that there was a 
statistically significant influence of the predictor variables on the outcome variable (R2 = 0.837, ad-
justed R2 = 0.825).  Therefore, the study concluded that Human Resources Management Practices as 
an omnibus concept have significant influence on Entrepreneurial firms ‘growth. The study suggested 
that Human Resource Management Practices should be considered as a process by entrepreneurs as 
it galvanizes entrepreneurial firms' growth objectives.  
 
Keywords: Catalyst, Developed economy, Entrepreneur, Entrepreneurial firms’ growth, Human re-
source management practice 

Journal of  
Humanities, Social 

Sciences and Creative 
Arts 

 

ISSN: 
Print      -  2277 - 078X  
Online   -  2315 - 747X 
© UNAAB 2020 

INTRODUCTION 
The determinant of several successful entre-
preneurial firms in different categories in 
the developed economies can be traced to 
the attention paid to the management of 
human capital through well-organized and 
effective application of human resource 
management practices. Organisational ex-

perts are witnesses of inadequate HRM prac-
tice in today's organisation and the economic 
challenges occasioned by globalization in less 
developed economies like Nigeria. Extant 
literature also reveals the immediate need for 
the active involvement of government in less 
developed countries to create changes for 
rapid adaptation to new conditions by firms 
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ployees to make the desired contribution to 
organisational growth. Over the years, re-
searchers have suggested many human re-
source management practices (HRMPs) 
which are capable of improving firms' per-
formance and achieving their growth objec-
tives. Gerrard and Ondabu (2014), quoting 
Pfeffer (1998) listed effective human re-
source management practices (HRMPs) as 
follows: employment security, the selective 
hiring of employees, self-managed teams, 
decentralization of decision making amongst 
others.  
 
Oladejo (2018) opines that organisational 
growth is the improvement in output and 
maintenance of organisational well-being.   
He further emphasized that a business con-
cern is said to be growing when employees 
are happy and satisfied with being part of the 
organisation, and when the organisation can 
retain its productive workers. It is also im-
perative for organisations to maintain their 
good standing in the public by not only en-
suring their products are meeting the prom-
ised value but should be fulfilling their social 
responsibilities in the communities where 
they are sited. Other indices or yardsticks to 
measure firms' growth are an increase in 
revenue period by the period as well as evi-
dence of skill acquisition and application by 
the employees for the betterment of their 
organisations.  A firm's growth also occurs 
when the top management has a relentless 
urge for product development as well as 
product market development. Basil (2005) 
opines that private businesses are the engine 
of growth. Therefore, it will not be out of 
place to pay attention to the growth of the 
entrepreneurial firms in Nigeria. This is be-
cause the experience of developed econo-
mies about the roles played by entrepreneu-
rial firms in the growth of the economies are 
testimonies that entrepreneurial firms can 

due to the turbulent situation and increasing 
complexity. Since such steps may not be 
sufficient to enhance the growth of firms, it 
is therefore imperative for a unique and 
adequate human resource management 
practice to be entrenched across various 
organisations. Organisation creativity and 
adaptability for overall firms' growth may 
depend on the skills, knowledge, and crea-
tivity of the employees. Galbraith (1985) 
emphasized the role of human resources in 
the development of firms.   
 
All the same, human resource management 
practice is a process that interacts with the 
constituent sections of the organisation.  Its 
practice encompasses employee engage-
ment, employee orientation, and reward 
systems. In addition, human resource man-
agement as a process enhances equal em-
ployment opportunity, occupational safety, 
and health, employment retirement income 
security among the employees. It also im-
proves the lots of the affected group of 
people in their various locations thus fulfill-
ing the expectation of the people where 
these firms are cited. 
 
Entrepreneurial firms are simply the inno-
vating firms enhancing competitive advan-
tage above their competitors. The individu-
als behind the wheels of the entrepreneurial 
firms make the difference. They had learned 
the skills required to start a business, or 
bring new ideas to an established organisa-
tion, and gained hands-on experience in 
preparing business plans and presenting 
pitches to industry experts. HRM practices 
are effective tools to assist entrepreneurial 
firms and other forms of business organisa-
tions in attracting and reducing labour turn-
over rate as well as bringing about a skilled 
workforce. The logic behind HRM practices 
is to have strong and highly motivated em-
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unionization.  Also, the generic list of HRM 
practices when employed as a process will 
enhance equal opportunity and fairness in 
the way employment contracts are imple-
mented.  This is capable of reducing to the 
barest minimum employees' intentions to 
quit the organisation. The study will also 
open the eyes of business executives and en-
trepreneurs to the crucial need for an inde-
pendent audit of human resource manage-
ment practices to measure the degree and 
operative use of HRM practice in various 
organisations.   
The extant literature reveals several human 
resources management practices (HRMPs) to 
enhance firms' growth objectives. For in-
stance, Gerrard and Ondabu (2014), cited 
Pfeffer (1998) mentioned employment secu-
rity, the selective hiring of employees, self-
managed teams, and decentralization of deci-
sion making amongst others in the list of 
Human Resources Management Practices 
that can be adjudged as a veritable tool en-
hancing workers' performance.  Yet, organ-
isational leaders are going all-out to find ef-
fective ways of managing and improving the 
firm's activities for the achievement of 
growth objectives through their employees; 
hence this study. 
 
Research Objectives 
The specific objectives of the study are to: 
i. ascertain the Human Resource Manage-

ment Practice employed in selected En-
trepreneurial firms in Nigeria;  

ii. examine Entrepreneurial Firms Growth 
factors; 

iii. investigate the nexus between Human 
Resource Management Practice (HRMP) 
and Entrepreneurial firms’ growth; and 

iv. evaluate the influence of human resource 
management practice as a process on 
Entrepreneurial firms' growth in Nigeria.   

also contribute immensely to the develop-
ment of less-developed or developing coun-
tries like Nigeria. 
 
Statement of the Problem  
Oladejo (2018) investigated Customer Rela-
tionship Management in selected Micro, 
Small and Medium Scale Enterprises in 
Southwest Nigeria and found that the Fed-
eral Government of Nigeria creates agen-
cies and made laws to assist the growth of 
Micro, Small and Medium Scale Enterprises 
(MSMEs) in the country. He found out that 
government efforts at aiding the growth of 
MSMEs led to the mere proliferation of 
MSMEs in Nigeria without a remarkable 
growth rate. The stunted and eventual death 
of some of the firms at the infant stage was 
not unconnected with the inadequate hu-
man resources management practices as a 
process across diverse firms in the country. 
Human resources are catalysts for coordi-
nating other organisational resources for the 
successful operation of the firm.  
 
The present study is germane as it unfolds 
the roles of human resource management 
practice in the growth of private firms in 
Nigeria nation where recession just abated.  
It will empirically reveal the way and man-
ner that the HRMP is implemented in dif-
ferent entrepreneurial firms.  The study will, 
of course, demystify the popular saying 
among the employees that some HRM 
practices are valuable than others.  Hence, 
the study would come up with a list of ge-
neric HRM practices which could be em-
ployed as a process to foster the growth of 
the nation's nascent entrepreneurial firms.  
The generic list of HRMPs will curb private 
employers’ excesses as workers in private 
firms rarely have effective unions as com-
pared to public sectors with a high level of 
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percussions of every action that may affect 
financial performance of an organisation.  
The HR policies explain philosophies and 
values relating to the fair treatment of em-
ployees. Therefore, HRM practices should 
give emphasis to a variety of well-conceived 
Human Resource Policies and Practices and 
the effective implementation of practices and 
policies identified. 
 
Further, Boselie  (2005) recognized 26 vari-
ous practices adopted in 104 diverse studies 
and came up with four top practices of 
HRM which include well-organized job re-
cruitment and employee selection, employee 
training and development, likelihood and 
payment system, and job evaluation.  These 
four practices describe the main objectives 
of strategic HRM programmes which include 
employing the right candidate for the job 
advertised, make available to the employee, 
the requisite skills and self-assurance to un-
dertake assignment effectively with necessary 
orientation and pieces of training, as well as 
effective performance management to moni-
tor workers' performance. In the modern 
time, strategic HR management practices 
include equal employment opportunity, Em-
ployment retirement income security, Occu-
pational safety, and health. Altinay, Altinay 
and Gannon (2008) examined HRM prac-
tices using employee training, empowerment, 
recruitment, and reward to the employee. 
Directors can use HRM programme to influ-
ence employee productivity. 
 
Relationship between HRM Practices 
and Organisation Performance 
Effective human resource management is 
essential for firms’ performance and growth.  
For effective organisation and management 
of human resources, a generic array of HRM 
practices is germane because organisations 
who continually improve human resource 

Hypotheses 
The hypotheses were stated in the null form 
as follows: 
Ho 1: There is no statistically significant 

association between Human Re-
source Management Practice 
(HRMP) and Entrepreneurial firms’ 
growth in the study area 

 
Ho 2: There is no statistically significant 

influence of Human Resource Man-
agement Practice (HRMP) as a 
process on Entrepreneurial firms’ 
growth.  

 
EXTANT LITERATURE  

Conceptual Review 
Armstrong (2006) succinctly defines human 
resources management as the strategies, 
practices, and structures that influence em-
ployee’s behaviours, attitudes, and perform-
ance.  Stone (1998) opines that human re-
source management is either part of the so-
lution or problem to gain productive contri-
bution of every employee. This suggests the 
paramount place of effective HRM prac-
tices in the development and growth of 
both the public and private sectors. Kay 
(1999) agreed to this by alluding to the fact 
that the Human Resource Policy is an inte-
gral part of the organisation‘s planning 
processes that contribute to the organisa-
tion‘s total objective. Guest (1999) built on 
the work of Pfeffer and Stone (1998) placed 
forward an array of Human Resource Prac-
tices which include job design in a way that 
employees enjoy autonomy in the execution 
of their assigned responsibilities; selection 
process is programmed to cautiously iden-
tify possible training as a continuous activity 
which is in two-way communication proc-
ess (effective communication) that informs 
every employee and improve employee par-
ticipation and consciousness about the re-
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and internal business environments to ac-
quire experiences to formulate potential 
strategies, and apply such strategies for 
needed change to occur in the ways business 
organisation are being run; for the achieve-
ment of the organisational goals and objec-
tives in which growth objective is key.  
 
The descriptive theory, in turn, describes 
Human Resources Management (HRM) as 
one element and the proponents present its 
components such as objectives, vision, 
strategies, actions, and stakeholders to ob-
serve all these components as ingredients for 
achieving the desired organisation’s objec-
tives.  Normative theory is more doctrinaire 
in its method of providing theoretical expla-
nations to Human Resources Management.  
In order to explain the normative theory, 
Walton (1985) adduces a common assurance 
approach and the best - practice (Pfeffer, 
1994). Normative theory embraces mutuality 
in goals, in influence, in respect, in reward 
allocation, and mutuality in responsibility; 
thus enhancing the quality and behaviour of 
human resource leading to high organisation 
members’ commitment.  
 
In addition, Delery and Doty (1996) further 
divide normative theory into three kinds 
which are the universalistic, contingency, and 
configurationally models. The contingency 
model delineates the association between the 
independent variable and the dependent vari-
able based on the firm’s proportion, age, the 
technology employed, the amount of capital 
outlay, the extent of union formation, indus-
try sector a firm belongs, as well as owner-
ship and the firm’s location.  Conversely, 
configurations model affirms the need for 
the integration of relevant constructs in post-
ing a suitable HRM theory. Arthur's (1994) 
control and commitment HR systems can be 
alluded to as a configuration of business 

management practices will attain a support-
able economical advantage, enhance busi-
ness profitability and competitiveness.  
Also, HRM practices stimulate organisa-
tional members, foster full potential, and 
bring success to all the organisational mem-
bers.  
 
Delaney and Huselid (1996) and Bowen and 
Ostroff (2004), advocate HR practices 
which impact on individual performance. In 
the present time, where competition is rife 
due to business uncertainties and globaliza-
tion, industry leaders and business execu-
tives do not have any other tools handy 
which are good enough to initiate an instant 
competitive strategy; the safety net is the 
effective application of HRM practices. 
However, there is increased attention on the 
different internal consistency of HRM ac-
tivities. 
 
When HRM practices are consider as an 
omnibus concept will better than the sepa-
rate parts of the sum. The present study 
seeks the evaluation and ultimate develop-
ment of a universal array of HRM practices 
as an omnibus concept for effective HR 
management to enhance the growth of en-
trepreneurial firms in the developing coun-
tries like Nigeria.  
 
Theoretical Foundation for the Study 
In the organisation literature, certain au-
thors had classified HRM theories into 
three principal categories. Guest (1997) 
classified Human Resources Management 
theory into three broad categories as fol-
lows: Strategic Human Resources theory 
(SHRMT), Descriptive Human Resources 
Management theory (DHRMT) and Nor-
mative Human Resources Management the-
ory (NHRMT).  The strategic theory places 
attention on the influence of the external 
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mount to take a cursory look at HRM prac-
tices as documented by some organisational 
researchers on HRM practices in their vari-
ous studies. 
 
Merima (2014) documented the study of 
Noe, Hollenbeck, Gerhart, and Wright 
(2010) which examined the impact of HRM 
practices which include selection, training, 
compensation and appraisal, and participa-
tion of financial performance of 190 United 
States Petrol Chemical Refineries and estab-
lished a direct association between training 
and compensation with workforce motiva-
tion. Merima (2014) posited that it is under a 
highly participative system only that human 
resource practices such as selection, compen-
sation, and appraisal are positively associated 
with firms' performance. 
 
Chifashu (2012) documented the finding of 
Yeung and Berman (1997) whose study es-
tablished that human resource procedures 
should be inactive rather than activity orien-
tated and direct attention to the entire hu-
man resource arrangement and not only a 
distinct Practices. 
 
Cao (2014) documented the research finding 
of Akhtar, Ding,, and Ge (2008). on 465 
Chinese enterprises who reported that four 
core strategic HRM practices have positive 
influences both on product/service perform-
ance and financial performance. These four 
core strategic HRM practices are training, 
participation, results-oriented appraisals, and 
internal career opportunities. These provide 
the opportunity for nurturing, participating, 
motivating, and promoting professional and 
managerial employees Cao (2014).  Ngo, 
Lau, and Foley (2008) reported that state-
owned enterprise used less HRM practices 
than foreign-invested enterprises and pri-
vately owned enterprises; and achieving 

constructs enhancing the achievement of 
the corporate objectives of the organisation. 
 
This study is anchored on the Universalistic 
theory which is another division of the nor-
mative theory. The universalistic theory as-
sociates with the best practice and high-
performance work practices. This theory 
explains the linearity in the association be-
tween human resource practices or struc-
tures and firm’s performance. It explains 
HRM norms being universally applicable 
and leads to the firm’s successful operation. 
In the final analysis, the universalistic theory 
attributes a firm’s success with indicators of 
financial performance like market share, 
level of sales and profits. These perform-
ance indicators are part of the key growth 
indicators adopted for use in this study. Os-
terman (1994), Pfeffer (1994) and Huselid 
(1995) are the main proponents of the uni-
versalistic theory.    
 
This theory is relevant to the present study 
as there is a need for universal HRM prac-
tices to effectively manipulate human re-
source to achieve a firm’s growth. It is es-
sential to put forward  a set of best HRM 
practice that any organisation can adopt 
anywhere - the general objective of this 
study( i.e. identifying and evaluating HRM 
practices in entrepreneurial firms in Nige-
ria). Thus, contributing to the literature on 
Human Resource Management Practices 
(HRMPs) and enhancing the growth objec-
tive of entrepreneurial firms in Nigeria. 
 
Previous Studies 
In a bid to investigate the contribution of 
human resource management practices as 
tools for firms competitive advantage on 
one hand; and on the other hand to be able 
to suggest a generic array of human re-
source management practices, it is para-
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sion areas paving ways to entrepreneurial 
firms’ growth. Schuler (1986) maintains that 
dependable HRM practices enhance entre-
preneurship. 

competitive advantage than the State-owned 
firm. Therefore, human resource manage-
ment practices as an omnibus concept 
would be a sine qua non to managerial deci-
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EFFECTIVE HRMPs FIRM’S GROWTH  

Teams and job-
redesign 

High wages,  

Incentive pay, 

Employee owner-
ship, 

Information sharing,  

Participation and 
empowerment 

Employee presence 

Employee motiva-
tion 

Employee satisfac-
tion 

Employee retention 

Job Analysis and De-
sign 
 
Manpower Planning 

Recruitment and se-
lection  

Employees training 
and development 

Organizing Employ-
ees 

Controlling 

Motivating Strategies  

Performance manage-
ment opportunity 
 
Employment retirement 
income security 
Occupational safety and 
health 

Customer Retention 
 
Public Image  
 
Maintenance 
 
Increased Business  
Revenue 
 
Employee Satisfac-
tion and Retention 
 
Product Develop-
ment 
 
Product market de-
velopment 
 
Evidence of skill ac-
quisition and appli-
cation by the  em-
ployment 

HIGH 

LOW 

Im-
proved 
HRMPs 
Lead to 
High 

Poor 
HRMPs 
Lead to 
Low 

Confounding Variables: 
Gender; Work experience; 
Qualification 

Figure 1: Conceptual framework on human resource management practices and entrepre-
neurial firms’ growth 

Source:  Author (2019) 

METHODOLOGY 
The study employed a survey research de-
sign.  The independent variable was the Hu-
man Resource Management Practice. The 

dependent variable was Entrepreneurial 
Firms' Growth (EFG). Respondents in the 
study were drawn from 60 Entrepreneurial 
firms in Lagos, Ibadan, and Abeokuta which 
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by analyzing the data obtained on all vari-
ables using descriptive and inferential statis-
tics as follows. 
 
Objective One: To ascertain Human Re-
sources Management Practices employed in 
selected Entrepreneurial firms in Southwest, 
Nigeria  
 
To achieve this objective, the mean and stan-
dard deviation of Human resources manage-
ment practice factors were computed with 
the aid of the Statistical Package for Social 
Sciences (SPSS version 21). Every human 
resource management practice factor exam-
ined was rated on a 4-point scale.  Bench-
mark for an agreement was established as 
well as a benchmark for disagreement.  
Agreement criterion was set at weighted 
mean ≥ 23.0 while the benchmark estab-
lished for disagreement criterion was when 
weighted mean is < 23.0.   The results as 
shown in table one below, revealed that em-
ployees’ training (   = 31.03, s = 8.6405); 
controlling (   = 25.95, s = 6.721)); organiz-
ing manpower (   = 23.20, s = 5.760); job 
analysis, design and advertisement (   = 
22.88, s = 5.883) fell within the agreement 
criterion that they are being reasonably prac-
ticed in the firms under this study. Whereas 
motivating strategies (   = 21.5, s = 5.2905; 
Recruitment and selection (   = 20.45, s = 
4.831); and manpower planning (   = 8.72, s 
= 1.786) fell below the agreement criterion 
that their practice are still below the expecta-
tion of participants in this study in their or-
ganisations. 

are capital cities of Lagos, Ogun, and Oyo 
states in Southwest, Nigeria respectively.  In 
order to determine adequate sample size for 
the study, the values of significance level, 
and effect size were well-thought-out to 
optimize sampling effort within the con-
straint of the available resources. Then, 
Krejcie and Morgan’s (1970) sample size 
table was applied to decide on the sample 
size for the study which was 60 respondents 
who were either Human Resource Manager 
or Personnel Manager. A structured-
questionnaire was used for collecting data 
from the participants. The questionnaire 
was divided into three sections. The first 
section (SECTION A) elicited information 
on demographic characteristics of respon-
dents. The second section (SECTION B) 
stimulated information on various Human 
Resource Management Practices (HRMPs).  
The third section (SECTION C) was based 
on questions relating to Entrepreneurial 
Firms Growth. Entrepreneurial Growth in 
this study was measured with factors such 
as customer retention, revenue growth, em-
ployees’ satisfaction and retention, product 
development, and product market develop-
ment, market share, skill acquisition and 
application by employees; while the predic-
tor variable (Human Resources Manage-
ment Practice) was measured with Job 
Analysis and Design, Manpower Planning, 
Recruitment and Selection, Organizing 
Manpower, Employees’ Training, Control-
ling, and Motivating strategies. 
 

RESULTS 
The objectives of the study were achieved 
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lished for disagreement criterion was when 
weighted mean is < 13.4. It is crystal clear 
that the firms under this study experienced 
an appreciable growth. Virtually, all the fac-
tors examined met the agreement criterion 
i.e. the predictor variables enhanced firms’ 
growth in southwest Nigeria (see table 2).  

Objective Two: Examination of Entrepre-
neurial Firms Growth Factors 
 
In examining entrepreneurial firms’ growth, 
a benchmark for agreement was established 
as well as a benchmark for disagreement.  
Agreement criterion was set at weighted 
mean ≥13.4 while the benchmark estab-
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Motivating Strategies 60 21.5 5.2905 
Controlling 60 25.95 6.721 

Organizing the Manpower 60 23.2 5.760 
Job Analysis, Design, and Advertisement 60 22.88 5.883 

Recruitment and Selection 60 20.45 4.831 
Manpower Planning 60 18.72 4.786 
Valid N (list wise) 60     

R= Remark where A = Agreement is ≥ 23.0 D =disagreement= > 23.0   
Source: Author’s Computation, 2019 

Table 2:   Descriptive Analysis of Entrepreneurial Firms Growth Factors in the Study Area 

Descriptive Statistics 
  N Mean Std. Deviation 
Employee satisfaction and retention 60 8.85 2.893 
Customer Retention 60 11.60 3.637 
Product Development 60 11.80 3.857 
Product Market Development 60 13.63 3.221 
Business Revenue 60 12.42 3.221 
Public Image Maintenance 60 15.53 3.342 
Evidence of skill acquisition and appli-
cation by the employees 60 20.30 2.824 

Valid N (listwise) 60     

R= Remark where A = Agreement is ≥13.4; D =disagreement= <13.4 
Source: Author’s Computation, 2019 

Objective Three: Investigation of the 
nexus between Human Resources Manage-
ment Practices (HRMPs) Factors  
 
In investigating the relationship between 

Human Resources Management Practice 
(HRMPs) and Entrepreneurial firms’ growth, 
a correlational analysis which shows the rela-
tionship between human resource manage-
ment practice (predictor variable) and firms’ 
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Table 1:    Descriptive Analysis of Human Resources Management Practices in selected 
Entrepreneurial firms in Southwest, Nigeria                                              

Items N Mean Std. Deviation 
Statistic Statistic Statistic 

Employees’ Training 60 31.03 8.6405 



job analysis and design and business revenue 
(r = .814, p < 0.001); job analysis and design 
and public image maintenance (r = .951, p < 
0.001); job analysis and design and customer 
retention (r = 0.710, p < 0.001).  Also, there 
was a statistical significant relationship be-
tween manpower planning and employee 
satisfaction and retention, product develop-
ment, product market development, business 
revenue, public image maintenance, and cus-
tomer retention (r = 0.505, p < 0.001), (r = 
0. 416, p < 0.05), (r = 0.936, p < 0.001), (r = 
0 .739, p < 0.001), (r = 0 .986, p < 0.001), (r 
= 0.525, p < 0.001) respectively. 

growth (outcome variable) was carried out. 
With the exception of skill acquisition and 
application by the employees which was 
found out to have no statistically significant 
relationship with the predictor variable, all 
other factors of the outcome variable had a 
statistically significant relationship with the 
predictor variable.  
These include: job analysis and design and 
employee satisfaction and retention (r = 
0 .673, p < 0.001); job analysis and design 
and product development (r = 0. .579, p < 
0.001); job analysis and design and product 
market development (r = 0.970, p < 0.001); 
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Table 3:     Correlation 
ITEMS  

  
Employee 
satisfac-
tion and 
retention 

Prod-
uct 

Devel-
opment 

Product 
Market 
Devel-
opment 

Busi-
ness 

Reve-
nue 

Public 
Image 

Mainte-
nance 

Skill acquisi-
tion and ap-
plication by 

the employees 

Customer 
Retention 

Job Analysis, 
and Design 

Pearson  
Correlation 

.673** .579** .970** .814** .951** .186 .710** 

Sig. (2-tailed) .000 .000 .000 .000 .000 .155 .000 
N 60 60 60 60 60 60 60 

Manpower 
Planning 

Pearson  
Correlation 

.505** .416* .936** .739** .986** .108 .525** 

Sig. (2-tailed) .001 .001 .000 .000 .000 .412 .000 
N 60 60 60 60 60 60 60 

Recruitment 
and Selec-

tion 

Pearson  
Correlation 

.562** .457** .863** .651** .982** .165 .696** 

Sig. (2-tailed) .000 .000 .000 .000 .000 .207 .000 
N 60 60 60 60 60 60 60 

Organising 
the Man-

power 

Pearson  
Correlation 

.545** .685** .796** .812** .968** .171 .726** 

Sig. (2-tailed) .000 .000 .000 .000 .000 .191 .000 
N 60 60 60 60 60 60 60 

Employees’ 
Training 

Pearson  
Correlation 

.585** .585** .624** .596** .968** .171 .726** 

Sig. (2-tailed) .000 .000 .000 .000 .000 .191 .000 
N 60 60 60 60 60 60 60 

Motivating 
Strategies 

Pearson  
Correlation 

.575** .575** .599** .911** .976** .169 .713** 

Sig. (2-tailed) .000 .000 .000 .000 .000 .198 .000 
N 60 60 60 60 60 60 60 

Controlling 

Pearson  
Correlation 

.699** .529** .789** .849** .954** .175 .743** 

Sig. (2-tailed) .000 .000 .000 .000 .000 .181 .000 
N 60 60 60 60 60 60 60 

Source: Author’s Computation, 2019 
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clearly shows that the predictor variables - 
job analysis, design and advertisement, man-
power planning, recruitment and selection, 
and controlling are catalysts in the variation 
in the growth of entrepreneurial firms in the 
study area ( R2 = 0. 837, adjusted R2 = 0. 
.825, p = 0.000) suggesting that 82.5% of the 
improvement in entrepreneurial firms’ 
growth was due to effective application of 
human resource management practices in the 
studied firms (see table 4.1 - 4.2 below) 

‘Recruitment and selection’, ‘organising the 
manpower’ ,  employees’ training’ , 
‘motivating strategies’, as well as 
‘controlling’ all had a statistically significant 
relationship with the outcome variable (see 
table 3) . 
 
Objective Four: Evaluation of the influ-
ence of HRMPs on the Entrepreneurial 
Firms’ growth in Nigeria.  
The result of the analysis on the evaluation 
of human resources management practice 
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Table 4.1: Model Summary 

Mod
el 

R R 
Square 

Ad-
justed 

R 
Square 

Std. An 
error of 

the Esti-
mate 

      Change Statistics 
R Square 
Change 

F 
Change 

df1 df2 Sig. F 
Chang

e 
1 .915a .837 .825 7.730 .837 70.680 4 55  .000 

Source: Author’s Computation, 2019 

Table 4.2: ANOVA 

Model Sum of Squares df Mean Square F Sig. 

1 

Regression 16893.257 4 4223.314 70.680 .000b 

Residual 3286.393 55 59.753     

Total 20179.650 59       

a. Dependent Variable: Entrepreneurial Firms Growth 

b. Predictors: (Constant), Controlling, Manpower Planning, Job Analysis, Design and Adver-
tisement, Recruitment and Selection 

Source: Author’s Computation, 2019 

Test of the Hypotheses 
Hypothesis One: 
Ho: There is no statistically significant 

association between Human Re-
sources Management  P r a c t i c e s 
(HRMPs) and Entrepreneurial 
firms’ growth in the  study area? 

 
Given the results of the correlational analy-
sis in the below table, which shows a statis-

tically impressive association between the 
predictor variable and the outcome variable 
(r = 0.90, p = 0.000); therefore, the null hy-
pothesis was rejected that there is no statisti-
cally significant association between HRMPs 
and Entrepreneurial firms growth; and the 
alternate hypothesis was accepted that there 
is a statistically significant association be-
tween HRMPs and Entrepreneurial firms 
growth. 
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results of the analysis showed a statistically 
significant influence of the predictor variable 
on the outcome variable when the gender of 
the employees in the study, qualifications, 
and work experiences were considered as 
confounding variables. Hence, we reject the 
null hypothesis and accept the alternate hy-
pothesis. 

Hypothesis Two: 
Ho: There is no statistically significant 

influence of Human Resources 
Management Practices (HRMPs) 
factors on Startups and Entrepre-
neurial firms’ growth. 

  
A hierarchical multiple regression statistics 
was used in testing this hypothesis.  The 
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Table 5: Correlations  

ITEMS HUMAN RE-
SOURCES MANAGE-
MENT PRACTICES 

 Entrepreneu-
rial Firms 
Growth 

HUMAN RE-
SOURCES MANAGE-
MENT PRACTICES 

Pearson Correlation 1 .900** 

Sig. (2-tailed)   .000 

Entrepreneurial Firms 
Growth 

Pearson Correlation .900** 1 
Sig. (2-tailed) .000   

Source: Author’s Computation, 2019 
**. Correlation is significant at the 0.01 level (2-tailed). 

Table 6a: ANOVA 

Model Sum of squares df Mean square F Sig 
Regression 503659.475 3 167886.492 154.304 .000a 
1.    residual 2017.525 57 1088.027     
Total 565677.000a 60       
Regression 560811.716 7 80115.959 872.744 .000a 
2.    residual 4865.284 53 91.798     
Total 565677.000a 60       

Dependent Variable:  Entrepreneurial Firms Growth 
Predictors: Gender, Qualification, Work experience of the officer, Controlling, Manpower 

Table 6b: Model Summary,e 
Mod

el 
R R 

Square 
Adjusted 
R Square 

Std. An 
error of the 
Estimate 

Change Statistics   
R Square 
Change 

F 
Change 

df1 df2 Sig. F 
Change   

1 .944a .890 .885 32.985 .890 154.304 3 58 .000   
2 .996c .991 .990 9.581 .101 155.647 4 54 .000   

a. Predictors: Gender, Qualification, Work experience of the officer 
c. Predictors: Gender, Qualification, Work experience of the officer, Controlling, Man-

power Planning, Job Analysis, Design and Advertisement, Recruitment and Selection 
d. Dependent Variable:  Entrepreneurial Firms Growth 
Source: Author’s Computation, 2019 
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82.5% variation in the improvement in 
startup and entrepreneurial firms’ growth 
was due to human resources management 
practices in the studied firms.  
  
This study also ascertained the fact that, 
when gender, qualification and work experi-
ence of the employees were considered as 
confounding variables, the predictor vari-
ables as a process, still have a statistically sig-
nificant influence on entrepreneurial firms' 
growth under this study.  These findings fur-
ther confirm the study of Yeung and Ber-
man's (1997) where it was declared that HR 
measures should be impact rather than activ-
ity orientated. Also, the assertion of Paauwe 
and Hose lie, 2005 that the bundle of HRM 
practices is more than the sum of the sepa-
rate parts was confirmed by the findings in 
this study.     
 
This study, therefore, suggests the effective 
application of job analysis and design, man-
power planning, recruitment and selection, 
and controlling as a process would be a sine 
qua non to managerial decision areas paving 
ways to improved entrepreneurial firms’ 
growth in Nigeria.  
 

CONCLUSION AND  
RECOMMENDATIONS 

The study examined the impact of human 
resource management practices on entrepre-
neurial firms' growth in Nigeria. From this 
study, it is abundantly clear that the effective 
application of human resource management 
practices as a process is a catalyst for en-
hancing firms' growth.  Therefore, firms’ 
operators should embrace the effective appli-
cation of the identified HRMPs as a process 
for the smooth running and growth of entre-
preneurial firms.  

DISCUSSION OF FINDINGS 
 In order to establish effective human re-
source management practice with entrepre-
neurial firms’ growth in mind, an extensive 
analysis was done on both predictor and 
outcome variables. Factors analyzed with 
respect to the outcome variable were prod-
uct development, product market develop-
ment, skill acquisition and application by 
employees, employee satisfaction and reten-
tion, business revenue, public image mainte-
nance, and customer retention. An array of 
human resources management practice fac-
tors analyzed included job analysis and de-
sign, manpower planning, recruitment, and 
selection, organizing the manpower, em-
ployees’ training, controlling, and motivat-
ing strategies.  Also, the gender of employ-
ees, qualifications and work experience were 
considered as confounding variables.    
 
As earlier presented employees’ training, 
controlling, organizing manpower, job 
analysis, and design, was found to be rea-
sonably practiced in the firms under this 
study. Whereas, motivating strategies, re-
cruitment and selection, and manpower 
planning which fell below the agreement 
criterion in this study should be enhanced 
by the management of the organisations in 
the study..  Also, factors of the outcome 
variable had a statistically significant rela-
tionship with the predictor variable (r = 
0.90, p = 0.000). These findings confirm the 
result of the study of Noe, et al (2010) 
which examined the impact of HRM prac-
tices and found out that a direct relationship 
exists between training and compensation 
with workforce motivation which may lead 
to firms’ growth. Further analyses showed a 
significant positive influence of the predic-
tor variable on the outcome variable R2 = 0. 
837, adjusted R2= 0. .825 suggesting that 
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